
 

SITRADSOFTWARE LICENSE AGREEMENT  

 

IMPORTANT: 

 
PLEASE READ CAREFULLY THE TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THIS 

LICENSE AGREEMENT BEFORE PROCEEDING WITH THE INSTALLATION OF 

THIS SOFTWARE, AS THIS AGREEMENT REFERS TO A LICENSE FOR 

NON-EXCLUSIVE USE OF SITRAD COMPUTER PROGRAM, HEREIN 

REFERRED TO AS SOFTWARE, THE COPYRIGHT OF WHICH IS OWNED BY 

ITS LICENSOR FULL GAUGE.THIS SOFTWARE IS PROTECTED BY 

COPYRIGHT AND RELATED LAWS, AS WELL AS BY THE SOFTWARE 

PROTECTION LAW IN FORCE IN THE COUNTRY. BY PROCEEDING WITH 

THE INSTALLATION OF SITRADSOFTWARE, THE LICENSEE 

ACKNOWLEDGES AND AGREES WITH THE TERMS OF THIS LICENSE 

AGREEMENT.  

 
On the one side, Full Gauge Eletro Controles Ltda, having its registered office at 
Rua Julio de Castilhos, 250 - Canoas - Rio Grande do Sul, registered in CNPJ 
under no. 90.446.048/0001-10, herein referred to as Licensor; and on the other 
side, the user, herein referred to as Licensee, who hereby agrees with the 
conditions set out below: 
 

1. LICENSE: The Licensor hereby grants the Licensee, and the Licensee hereby 

accepts for exclusive use in products manufactured by the Licensor, a 

non-exclusive license for installation and use of SITRADsoftware only in the 

form of computer-readable executable code, as well as the related documentation 

provided in this Agreement and in the applicable law in force. The Licensee agrees 

that it shall not assign, sublicense, transfer, pledge, hire, lease or share its license 

rights under this Agreement. It also agrees that it shall not disassemble, decompile 

or change SITRAD software in any way whatsoever.  

 

2. LICENSOR’S RIGHTS: The Licensee acknowledges and agrees that SITRAD 

software is exclusively owned by the Licensor and is protected by both 

International Conventions and Treaties to which Brazil is a signatory and local 

Laws and Decrees providing for Computer Programs and Copyrights. Also, it 



acknowledges and agrees that all rights, title and interest on SITRAD software, 

including any related rights, shall remain the property of the Licensor.  

 

3. Any publicity or exteriorization given to SITRADsoftware by the Licensee, 

shall bear a mention to Licensor as the sole rights holder, according the suggestion 

described in the following web page: http://www.sitrad.com/imagens/license.jpg 

 

4. CONNECTION AND CONDITIONS FOR USE: To use SITRAD software, the 

Licensee shall seek and select, under its exclusive responsibility, a trustworthy 

service provider to provide connection with the Internet, as necessary. 

 

5. LICENSE PRICE: The Licensee may use at no cost an unlimited number of 

copies of SITRAD software, provided that such copies are connected to products 
manufactured by the Licensor.  
 

6. WARRANTY: The Licensee is aware of SITRAD software features and that 
they will meet its requirements, and hereby exempts the Licensor from any liability 
for any eventual additional expectation with respect to the software. In this 

Agreement, the Licensor gives no warranty on SITRAD software or assumes any 
liability resulting from  misuse, accident, negligence, imprudence, unskillfulness, 
unauthorized attempted repairs or changes, power failure or any other direct or 

indirect damages eventually caused by the use of SITRAD software by the 
Licensee, its employees and representatives, including those arising from 
unforeseen and force majeure events referred to in art. 393 of the Brazilian Civil 
Code, and hereby agrees that no eventual financial or commercial losses (loss of 
benefit, business disruption, etc.) shall entitle the Licensee to any compensation by 
the Licensor. 
 

6.1. The Licensor hereby exempts itself from any liabilities for damages 

caused by decisions made on the basis of information provided by SITRAD 
software or any data included therein or handled by the Licensee.  
 

7. VALIDITY PERIOD: This Agreement shall be valid from the date of 

ACCEPTANCE AND INSTALLATION of SITRAD software and shall remain valid 

until its termination. The Licensor may terminate this Agreement in case of any 

violation of its terms, and in case of any breach by the Licensee of any other 

agreements between the Licensor and the Licensee. The Licensee may terminate 

this Agreement when it shall have no further interest in using SITRAD software 

connected to a product manufactured do the Licensor, or as soon as it shall stop 
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using this product.  
 

8. RESPONSIBILITIES: The Licensee shall be responsible for the installation and 

operation of SITRAD software and for maintaining backup copies in conditions of 
use of updated information and data. The Licensor shall post periodically on its 
website at www.sitrad.com.br (Portuguese version of the software) and 
www.sitrad.com (English and Spanish version of the software) updates and 

upgrades of SITRAD software, which shall also be governed by the provisions of 
this Agreement. It is the Licensee’s exclusive responsibility to check 
periodically for the existence of new versions and make their respective 
download.  
 

9. TERM: The term of this license is indeterminate. 

 

Special registration: number 51224. 
 
 
 

www.sitrad.com.br
www.sitrad.com

